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Introduction
Lebanon has faced numerous challenges in the last three 
decades that have greatly impacted its health-care sys-
tem, which has been historically disjointed first by the 
civil war (1975-1990), and second by the arrival of signif-
icant numbers of Palestinian and Syrian and refugees 
(1). Although Lebanon has tried to absorb these systemic 
shocks and recover, its health system has continued its 
slow decline and highlighted by events in 2020.

The fragility of health-care systems worldwide were 
demonstrated by the COVID-19 pandemic that emerged 
in 2020 (2). Protective measures that are essential to a 
health-care system (i.e. standardization of processes, 
analysis of adverse events, accreditation, etc.) are 
insufficient for handling unforeseen events (3). Lebanon 
suffered a hattrick of simultaneous events during 2020 
– the economic crisis, the Beirut blast and the COVID-19 
pandemic – which sorely tested its ability to orchestrate 
recovery efforts. These events have accelerated the 
slow demise of the Lebanese health-care system into a 
disastrous free fall. 

The economic crisis
Lebanon is facing its worst economic crisis since the civ-
il war. This was accompanied by a subsequent devalua-
tion of the Lebanese currency against the US dollar and 
curbs on international transfers out of the country (4). 
Lebanese hospitals rely mostly on imported products, 
especially stents, prostheses and medical devices, yet im-
porting such essential supplies was limited, translating 
into a huge financial burden on the health-care system 
and a lack of medical equipment (4). In reality, private 
hospitals provide the majority of Lebanon’s health ser-
vices. Although the government is supposed to refund 
them through the national social security and military 
funds, that fact is “private hospitals are owed US$ 1.3 bil-
lion and received no government funds at all in 2019” (4). 
Health-care workers have suffered pay cuts, deficiencies 
in equipment supplies, and unemployment. Patients are 
often unable to afford medical services impacted by the 
economic crisis, with more than 40% of the Lebanese 
population now living below the poverty line, especially 
in underserved areas (5).       

The Beirut blast
On 4 August 2020, the Beirut port was hit by one of the 
biggest explosions in its history (6). Regardless of the 
cause, the blast was devastating for the Lebanese health-
care system (7). Some 200 people died, 6000 were in-
jured, and tens of thousands were made homeless (8). 
The World Health Organization (WHO) confirmed that 
the blast caused damage to more than half of Beirut’s 
health infrastructure - three hospitals became non-func-
tional, three were extensively damaged, 500 hospital bed 
equivalents were lost, and many primary care facilities 
destroyed (8) - limiting the health service functionality 
essential for the response and management of such a cri-
sis (9). Given the massive flow of patients during such a 
short time frame, hospitals used up two months’ stock of 
medical supplies within days of the blast (10). Economic 
loss and physical damage were estimated to be US$ 8 bil-
lion according to the World Bank (8).  

COVID-19 pandemic
From the first documented case in Lebanon (21 February 
2020) until July 2020, COVID-19 cases were reportedly 
few in number, especially after a lockdown that was im-
plemented by the Lebanese authorities (11), and the sys-
tematic test and trace for symptomatic individuals as per 
WHO’s recommendations (12). This, along with the lim-
ited number of public places and transportation services 
in Lebanon, helped contain the spread of the disease and 
Lebanon stood out as one of the leading countries in con-
trolling the pandemic. Nevertheless, this reassuring state 
of affairs was short-lived. The number of cases started to 
gradually increase from July for various reasons, namely 
the opening of borders with no central quarantine pro-
gramme in place; and decreasing public compliance with 
government public health directions.

The response to the Beirut blast was the first 
weakening in controlling the COVID-19 pandemic. 
The urgent situation meant a huge number of patients 
required medical services all at the same time. Nearly all 
patients arrived wearing no masks due to their injuries 
and all were confined together in emergency departments. 
Thus, it could be said that the blast also destroyed the 
initial success Lebanon achieved in mitigating the spread 
of COVID-19. A substantial and unsurprising rise in the 



536

Commentary EMHJ – Vol. 27 No. 6 – 2021

number of positive cases was witnessed after 4 August 
(Figure 1), from a maximum of 100 daily cases before the 
event, to over 300 daily cases and seven deaths just one 
week after the blast. This first wave continued to reach a 
peak of circa 2000 cases by the end of October 2020 – 220% 
rise in cases as per the International Rescue Committee 
(13) – before a gradual decrease in reported numbers. 

The second destabilizing factor for the health-care 
system and its response to COVID-19 was the economic 
crisis. The Lebanese government had taken the decision 
not to undergo a lockdown during Christmas and New 
Year holidays, and retail outlets as well as restaurants 
remained open, despite the worrying number of COVID-19 
cases. The result was a dramatic surge in positive tests and 
reached circa 6000 cases by mid-January 2021 (Figure 1). 

These two devastating waves of COVID-19 infections 
crippled the Lebanese health-care system and shifted 
emphasis towards preparing public hospitals to receive 
COVID-19 patients. Moreover, diverting governmental 
funds has depleted primary health-care centres’ resources, 
threatening the permanence of their basic services. 
Lebanese hospitals have not prepared emergency risk 
management plans for crises such as epidemics (12). As 
a result, many private hospitals were drawn into the 
response and established COVID-19 care centres, while 
putting all elective surgeries on hold. Such steps placed 
significant economic hardship on private hospitals, 

which primarily rely on elective surgeries in order to 
maintain their financial viability, and so adding to the 
burden of both the economic crisis and the Beirut blast. 

This resulting deterioration in the health-care 
system, as well as its precarious financial state, have led 
numerous health-care professionals to leave the country 
and seek employment overseas, primarily the Gulf 
States, Europe and the United States of America. This is a 
serious workforce problem adding to the already fragile 
health system and undermines Lebanon’s reputation as 
the leading country in the Middle East for health-care 
expertise and facilities, renowned for its medical tourism.

Conclusion
The after-effects of this series of events on the Lebanese 
health-care system have meant it is on the verge of col-
lapse. Is there a possibility the system will endure and 
be able to orchestrate recovery efforts? And if yes, would 
this be achievable within the current political environ-
ment? Any progress to health-service sustainability re-
quires that lessons be learned from other countries in 
restructuring the basics of the health system, in order 
to develop effective crises management plans. It is only 
through planning for the unexpected that a country 
stands a chance of surviving the public health crises that 
Lebanon has been unfortunate enough to suffer.

Figure 1 Daily new COVID-19 cases in Lebanon divided into three phases, 2020 
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